Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ)

From: Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ)
Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 15:26
To: wraolane334@gmail.com; info@tirhisano.co.za; oupa@mintechsolutions.co.za;

yvone@elangeniservices.co.za; sales@bakwenasa.co.za; karabom@terryg.co.za;
sales@baytech.co za; navin@leishanit.co.za; carmen@csolum.co.za;
yoneloproductions@gmail.com; charne@aande.co.za; darin.ramtech@gmail.com;
info@delavista.co.za; tonny@bigotrading787.co.za; keenanp@siiahagroup.co.za;
nameesha@vcit.co.za; admin@momozar.co.za; info@akbtechnology.co.za;
tendors@destinyglobal.co.za; maboko.l.v@gmail.com;
cheslyn@browerenterprises.co.za; kgaogelo28m@gmail.com;
nophelo@wilgube.co.za

Cc: Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ); Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ);
Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ); Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ)

Subject: NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Good day

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-
user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been
cancelled. On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails
requesting proposals for the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could
not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.

Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.

Dimpho Molekwa|Unemployment Insurance Fund
UIF Head Office | Absa Towers |230 Lillian Ngoyi Street |Pretoria | Gauteng
Tel: +27 12 337 1905|066 483 9891 | Dimpho.Molekwa@LABOUR.gov.za
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Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ)

From: Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ)
Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 16:06
To: 'info@intellectualos.co.za’; jeffrey@intellectualos.co.za’; 'modisanal23

@sentshomi.co.za'; 'info@emalangenitech.co.za’,
'chantellem@emalangenitech.co.za’; 'sales@skyw.co.za’; ‘skyrfq@gmail.com’;
'info@sandilestat.com’; 'davey@dsnetworking.co.za'; info@mafcode.co za;
info@mercsystems.co.za; 'admin@bluevisiongroup.co.za’;
mafcodecenter@gmail.com; nkosiv@hotmail.com; sales@maxpectechnology.com;
sbmabasa82@gmait.com; info@phungo.com; chambrey@phungo.com;
mogolageneraldealers@gmail.com; mavhungujones@gmail.com;
'junior@unatech.co.za’; info@khulanigroup.co.za; ‘'vvincent.mudau@gmail.com’;
‘ardouenterprise@gmail.com'; osca@redefineit.co.za;
hankeringprojecis@gmail.com; jjcemmanuel1@gmail.com; info@luranga.co.za;
lurangatrading@gmail.com; kapathabang17@gmail.com;
lesdihomesupplier@gmail.com; info@nuadventure.co.za

Cc: Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Vishnu Moodley {UIF_HQ); Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ);
Mpfareleni Ravhutsi {UIF); Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ); Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ);
Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)

Subject: NOTICE OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES TENDER CANCELLATION

Good day,
| hope this email finds you well.

Please be advised that the tender for RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service
provider to supply end-user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-
six months, has been cancelled. On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 Sita contract,
UIF issued emails requesting proposals for the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025.
Unfortunately, the tender could not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials included in the
RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.
Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.

Regards,

Bongane Chamo

Senior Practitioner: (SCM} Acquisition Management
Tel: 012 337 1414

E-mail: bongane.chamo®@labour.gov.za




Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)
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From: Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)
Sent: 30 July 2025 15:25
To: '‘bhimboict@gmail.com’
Cc: Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ); Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ);

Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ); Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ); Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-
HQ); Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF)
Subject: NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Good day

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-user
devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been cancelled. On March
19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails requesting proposals for the tender, with
a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials
included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.
Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.
Refilwe Mokoena

Supply Chain Management |Unemployment Insurance Fund

UIF Head Office | Absa Towers | 230 Lillian Ngoyi Street |Pretoria | Gauteng
Tel: 012 337 1679 | Refilwe.mokoena2@labour.gov.za
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www.ufiling.co.za for more information.



Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)

From: Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)

Sent: 30 July 2025 15:19

To: 'lumacon@lumacon.co.za’; ‘thivhos@webmail.co.za’

Cc: Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ); Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ);

Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ); Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ); Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF);
Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ)
Subject: NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF REP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Good day

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-user
devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been cancelled. On March
19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails requesting proposals for the tender, with
a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials
included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.
Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.
Refilwe Mokoena

Supply Chain Management | Unemployment Insurance Fund

UIF Head Office | Absa Towers |230 Lillian Ngoyi Street | Pretoria | Gauteng
Tel: 012 337 1679 | Refilwe.mokoena2@labour.gov.za
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Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)

From: Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)
Sent: 30 July 2025 15:09
To: 'lazoesdesigns@gmail.com’; 'sumanth@getrading.co.za’; 'lumacon@lumacom.co.za’;

'tk2mpho@gmail.com; ‘info@tushia.co.za’; 'bids@monkainvest.co.za’;

‘admin@phiwolempilo.co.za’; 'patrickm@neo.co.za'; ‘bids@nambiti.co.za’;
‘info@brainet.co.za’; ‘'admin@providencesoft.com’; 'info@invokesolutions.co.za';
‘sarmashnin@sagecomp.co.za'; 'bompembeit@gmail.com’; 'info@bompembe.co.za’;
'‘bhimbict@gmail.com’; ‘tenders@aesolutions.za.com’; 'giniso@ndizais.co.za’;
'shaneal@lantic.net’; ‘'admin@shanealonline.co.za’;
'gugu.ntuli@futurebusiness.co.za’; ‘johannah@foursightit.co.za’;
'sales@yeboict.co.za’; ‘wadia@csiafrica.net’; ‘ianm@eclipseholdings.co.za’;
'sindziso.m@gmail.com’

Cc: Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ); Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ);
Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ); Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ); Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF);
Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ)

Subject: NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Good day

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-user
devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been cancelled. On March
19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails requesting proposals for the tender, with
a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials
included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.
Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.
Regards,

Refilwe Mokoena

Supply Chain Management | Unemployment Insurance Fund

UIF Head Office| Absa Towers | 230 Lillian Ngoyi Street |Pretoria | Gauteng
Tel: 012 337 1679 | Refilwe.mokoena2@labour.gov.za
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Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF)
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From: Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF)
Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 15:17
To: ‘mogodi@purplewire.co.za’; 'lavani.baloyi@gmail.com’; ‘thabo@value-vision.co.za’;

itstymgt@gmail.com’; 'khadziworx.kw@gmail.com'; 'info@cyberflare.co.za’;
‘arangahosales@gmail.com’; ‘globalafrigroup@gmail.com’;
'mabasasafety@gmail.com’; ‘abelramapelal@gmail.com’;
‘wonder@maxittechnologies.co.za'

Cc: Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ); Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ):
Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ); Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ); 'Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ)";
Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ)

Subject: RE: NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Good day

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-
user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been
cancelled. On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails
requesting proposals for the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could
not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.

Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.

Warm Regards

Mpfareleni Ravhutsi

Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF)

Tel 012 337 1918

Cell 066 483 9916
Mailto:MEfareleni.Ravhutsi@labour. oov.zZa
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Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:

Subject:

Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF)

Wednesday, 30 July 2025 15:03

wilson@semitech.co.za; sales@rhulvic.co.za; gauteng@pcpalace.co.za;
sales@remini.co.za; rescorporation@gmail.com; thembi@cyakhula.co.za;
sales@viewnet.co.za; admin@mn.co.za; sales@itqulate.co.za; tumelo@diventia.coza;
info@thikho.co.za; admin@Ivrprojects.co.za; siyasebenza1987@gmail.com

Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ); Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ);
Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ); Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ); Refilwe Mokoena (UIF-HQ):
Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ)

NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-
user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been

cancelled.

On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails

requesting proposals for the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could
not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.

Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.

Warm Regards

Mpfareleni Ravhutsi

Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF)
Tel 012 337 1918

Cell 066 483 9916

Mailto: Mgfareleni.Ravhutsi@labour. cov.za
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Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ)

From: Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 15:17

To: ‘wandilem@khanyayo.co.za'; 'sales@techteamsolutions.co.za’

Cc: Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ); 'refilwe.mokoena2@labour.gov.za'; Dimpho Molekwa

(UIF-HQ); Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF); Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ); Wilmari Kruger(UIF-
HQ); Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ)
Subject: FW: SUBJECT: NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Good day,

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-
user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been cancelled.
On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails requesting proposals for
the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could not be finalized due to
irregularities in the materials included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.

Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.

Regards,

Sedzani Maphiri

Senior Practitioner: (SCM) Acquisition Management

Tel: 012337 1587

Sedzani.maphiri@labour.gov.za

From: Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 15:08

To: wandilem@khanyo.co.za; MShinners@Mervynopolis.com; nester@thamanitech.com; idah@setsibi.co.za;
sales@setsibi.co.za; kgakakheguine7owl@gmail.com; kgakagolotrading@gmail.com; info@bariah.co.za;
bariah.k@gmail.com; sello@moagitech.co.za; info@amahleholdings.com; sisandandamase@gmail.com;
rendani@megacrossit.co.za; tenders@diopoint.co.za; rfg@enablingsolutions.co.za; mphemphu3@gmail.com;
johannes@seageng.co.za; dimpho@simplytech.co.za; info@reroxgroup.co.za; info@gtmcomputers.co.za;
ite.rankapole@gmail.com; info@tia-solutions.co.za; aviwe@mtechnologies.co.za; sales@techteamssolutions.co.za;
masala@ory-ts.co.za; makgabo.lamola@gmail.com; teresa@mastomax.co.za

Cc: 'refilwe.mokoena2@labour.gov.za' <refilwe.mokoena2@labour.gov.za>; Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ)
<Tshifhiwa.Phunyugu@LABOUR.gov.za>; Mpfareleni Ravhutsi (UIF) <Mpfareleni.Ravhutsi@LABOUR.gov.za>;
Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ) <Dimpho.Molekwa@labour.gov.za>; Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ)

<Bongane.Chamo@ LABOUR.gov.za>; Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ) <wilmari.kruger@labour.gov.za>; Vishnu Moodley
(UIF_HQ) <VishnuMoodley@labour.gov.za>

Subject: SUBJECT: NOTICE OF THE CANCELLATION OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES

Good day,

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-

user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been cancelled.

On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails requesting proposals for
1



the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could not be finalized due to
irregularities in the materials included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.
Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.
Regards,

Sedzani Maphiri

Senior Practitioner: (SCM) Acquisition Management

Tel: 012337 1587

Sedzani.maphiri@labour.gov.za




DimEho Molekwa (UIF-HQ)

From: Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ)
Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 14:55
To: tshifskilo@gmail.com; lucky.mondlani@intrinsyncdzumba.co.za;

tonny@bigotrading787.co.za; kulani.mindset@gmail.com;
nomtiwane@hotmail.co.za; sales@permaxmanufacturing.com;
odettem@sisazone.co.za; sylviam@batshait.co.za; mokgadim@batshait.co.za;
info@lammbtech.co.za; deon@esizwe.co.za; charles.reddy@redmps.com;
yokow@broadsmart.co.za; info@mosima.co.za; reabetswe@johnbak.co.za;
info@pro-space.co.za; gpsales@virtualize Itd; sales@zingweglobal.co.za;
fladha@govtek.co.za; info@ezevee.co.za; jmecuur@appleworxsa.co.za;
jrjtrading.enterprise@gmail.com; khuliso@jrjtrading.co.za; diphelaosp@gmail.com;
rhulanikhb@gmail.com; sales@peoit.co.za

Cc: Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ); Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ); Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ);
Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ); Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ)

Subject: NOTICE OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES TENDER CANCELLATION

Good day

| hope this email finds you well.

Please be advised that the tender for RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider
to supply end-user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months,
has been cancelled. On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 Sita contract, UIF issued emails
requesting proposals for the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could
not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.
Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.

Dimpho Molekwa| Unemployment Insurance Fund
UIF Head Office | Absa Towers | 230 Lillian Ngoyi Street |Pretoria | Gauteng
Tel: +27 12 337 1905 | 066 483 9891 | Dimpho.Molekwa@LABOUR.gov.za
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Dimeho Molekwa (UIF-HQ)

From: Dimpho Molekwa (UIF-HQ)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 15:06

To: dutoitj@virtualize-ltd.co.za; gpsales@virtualize-ltd.co.za

Cc: Bongane Chamo (UIF-HQ); Vishnu Moodley (UIF_HQ); Wilmari Kruger(UIF-HQ);
Tshifhiwa Phunyugu (UIF-HQ); Sedzani Maphiri(UIF-HQ)

Subject: NOTICE OF RFP1/25/26 END-USER DEVICES TENDER CANCELLATION

Good day

Please be advised that RFP1/25/26, which called for proposals to appoint a service provider to supply end-
user devices to the Unemployment Insurance Fund (UIF) for a period of thirty-six months, has been
cancelled. On March 19, 2025, in accordance with the RFB 740 SITA contract, UIF issued emails
requesting proposals for the tender, with a closing date of April 10, 2025. Unfortunately, the tender could
not be finalized due to irregularities in the materials included in the RFP, leading to its cancellation.

Please note that the tender will be re-issued in due course.
Thank you for your interest in working with the Fund.
Dimpho Molekwa|Unemployment Insurance Fund

UIF Head Office | Absa Towers | 230 Lillian Ngoyi Street | Pretoria | Gauteng
Tel: +27 12 337 1905|066 483 9891 | Dimpho.Molekwa@LABOUR.gov.za
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